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Skin Tube:  This is the column, or tube, of skin that is created either by pulling the slack shaft skin 
forward of the glans or tensioned with a foreskin restoration device.  It is similar to the foreskin in the 
intact state. 
 
Cylinder of rings: When installed, the multiple rings of the MetaMoreFore create a cylinder within 
which the skin tube resides. 
 
Bottom and Top End Rings: These are components and form the “ends” of the cylinder of rings as 
created with the MetaMoreFore. 
 
Set Rings: These are components of the MetaMoreFore and are slip over the skin tube as a means of 
constructing the cylinder of rings.  Set Rings come in five styles:  Standard, Wedged, DILE, Weighted, 
and Extreme Tensioning. 
 
Tensioning Plug: This component of the MetaMoreFore is a slightly conical shaped plug that serves to 
keep skin tensioned.  In other restoration devices, the “gripper” serves this purpose.  There is a hole in 
the Tensioning Plug to allow for the evacuation of urine. 
 
Set:  This refers to the construction of the initial cylinder of rings, which includes the Bottom End Ring, 
any installed Set Rings and the Top End Ring.  
 
Set Length:  This refers to the full length of all Set Rings that have been installed during the “set.”  This 
length does not include the length of the Bottom and Top End Rings (which in composite account for 
~1.8 cm of the full length upon “set”), but for convenience and since all “sets” require these rings, their 
length is not added to the “set length.”  For instance, a “set” using a 2.0 cm as well as a 1.0 cm Set Ring 
yields a “set length” of 3.0 cm.  But in actuality, ~5.8 cm of a skin tube has been created (~1.8 cm from 
the End Rings and 3.0 cm from the Set Rings). 
 
Expansion Rings: These are components of the MetaMoreFore and are inserted onto the skin tube 
(between two Set Rings) once the MetaMoreFore has been “set.”  These rings help to further tension 
the MetaMoreFore.  Expansion Rings come in three styles:  Standard, Wedged, Weighted and 
Strapping-Specific (Standard or Wedged). 
 
Strapping Cord: This component of the MetaMoreFore is a length of cord that is attached to a  
Strapping-Specific Expansion Ring or the Strapping Tensioning Ring. 
 
Meatus:  This is the opening in the glans through which urine flows. 
 
Glans Cap:  This is a component of the MetaMoreFore that covers the glans and is either used for 
“packing” of the MetaMoreFore or for use with the Bi-directional configuration.  Early in R&D this 
was revered to as the Helmet (as it is reminiscent of the helmet that a Storm Trooper would wear). 
 
Push Piston: This component of the MetaMoreFore is exclusivity used in a Bi-directional 
configuration.  Push Pistons come in three lengths (10, 12 and 14 cm) and have notches along one side 
so as to latch the Strapping Cord of the Strapping-Specific Expansion Ring. 


